=¥ LEE'S SUMMIT

Learning for Life

B-19/20-04
Best Buy Stores, L.P.
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number:
Title:

Type:

Issue Date:
Deadline:
Notes:

B-19/20-04

AV Classroom Tools

Contract Renewal

2/24/2021

3/24/2021 09:15 AM (CT)

Your contract with Lee's Summit R-7 will expire on April 30, 2021.
There is a provision to renew this contract for an additional (1) one-
year period. In accordance with the renewal provisions of Bid No. B-
19/20-04 AV Presentation Tools, Lee's Summit R-7 would like to
exercise its option to renew this agreement. This renewal period shall
be governed by the specifications, pricing, and the terms set forth per
contract executed. To help facilitate this process we are using the
District's electronic bidding system.

Please click on the link in this email and response to the requested
questions as well as upload the updated documentation.

Please indicate your desire to extend your services with the district
based on the same unit pricing formula/discount or any changes.

If pricing needs to be adjusted, please fill out the attached pricing
sheet and include the manufacturer/supplier documentation that
supports the price increase. The increase will be limited to the current
Federal Price Index,"CPI-U, All items" (Urban Consumers) index CPI
rate.

Please ensure that all applicable discounts are applied to invoices or
statements issued against purchase orders under this agreement and
that each purchase order number and RFP/Bid number is referenced
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on all invoices. This will ensure prompt payment for all items
purchased under this agreement. Invoices are to be submitted in
accordance with awarded RFP/bid requirements.

Contact Information

Contact: Jennifer Lalumondier
Address: Purchasing

702 SE 291 Highway

Lee's Summit, MO 64063-4306
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Best Buy Stores, L.P. Information

Address: 7601 Penn Avenue South
Richfield, MN 55423
Phone:  (800) 373-3050

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.
Steven Bell Steven.Bell@bestbuy.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 3/24/2021 9:13:17 AM

Requested Attachments

Price Increase Documentation No response
Please provide documentation for price increase when applicable.

Bid Attributes

1 | Renew at Existing Terms and Conditions

| agree to extend Bid No. B-19/20-04 AV Presentation Tools with the district. All terms and conditions of the original
agreement will remain the same.

|Yes |

2 | No Renewal
No, | do not wish to renew the contract at this time.

|We wish to renew

3 [ Renewal with Different Terms

I would like to extend Bid No. B-19/20-04 AV Presentation Tools, but will require adjustments to the price that was
included in the original contract.

Documentation of your requested changes must be upload to the response attachment tab, under the file name
Other Document.

Please note, the District will take under consideration your terms and conditions and will respond once a decision
has determined.

***Price increases must include supporting documentation in accordance to original bid agreement and may not
exceed CPI***

|No adjustments required |

4 | Insurance

If applicable, proof of insurance is required before any service is provided on district premises. Please upload a
certificate of insurance in the response attachments tab.

Bid Lines

1| Package Header

Small Television (32"-40")
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Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Total:

Package Attributes

$439.96 |

1. Brand Name

LG

2. Model Number

|32LM570BPUA

3. Size

132

4. 1080p Resolution

[No |
5. LED Screen Only

| Yes |

6. Input Sources

|HDMI (2min) |
7. Detachable Stand

|Yes |
8. Wall Mountable

|Yes |
9. Sound Output (analog)

| Yes |

10. Manufacturer Warranty

|l year |

Package Items

1.1 TV

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $189.99 | Total: | $189.99 |
1.2 Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $29.99| Total:| $29.99|
1.3 Floor Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1.4 Corner Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1.5 Total for TV w/ Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: Total Unit Price: $219.98| Total: | $219.98 |
Package Header
Medium Television (45"-55")
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Total: $859.96 |
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Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

ILG

2. Model Number

|55UN7000PUB

3. Size

|55

4. 1080p Resolution

|Yes |
5. LED Screen Only

|Yes |
6. Input Sources

|HDMI (2min) |
7. Detachable Stand

|Yes |
8. Wall Mountable

|Yes |
9. Sound Output (analog)

|Yes |
10. Manufacturer Warranty

|1 year |

Package Items

21TV

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $399.99| Total:| $399.99|
2.2 Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $29.99| Total:l $29.99|
2.3 Floor Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2.4 Corner Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2.5 Total for TV w/ Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Total Unit Price: $429.98| Total:| $429.98|
Package Header
Large Television (65"-80")
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Total: $1,099.96
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Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

LG |
2. Model Number

|65UN7000PUD |
3. Size

|65 |
4. 1080p Resolution

|Yes |
5. LED Screen Only

|Yes |
6. Input Sources

|HDMI (2min) |
7. Detachable Stand

|Yes |
8. Wall Mountable

|Yes |
9. Sound Output (analog)

|Yes |
10. Manufacturer Warranty

|1 year |

Package Items

31TV

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $519.99| Total:| $519.99|
3.2 Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $29.99| Total:l $29.99|
3.3 Floor Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3.4 Corner Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3.5 Total for TV w/ Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: Total Unit Price: $549.98| Total:| $549.98|

4 | Package Header

Short Throw Projector
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

[No response

2. Model Number

|No response

3. Grade

INo response |

4. 3600 Lumens (minimum)

[No response |

5. Multiple Input Sources

INo response |

6. LED or Bulb
Please list Model Number

|No response |

7. Compatible with Widescreen Display Source Ratios

INo response |

8. Manufacturer Warranty

[No response |

Package Items

4.1 Projector
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
4.2 Mounting Bracket
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

No Bid

S [Package Header

Ceiling Projector
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Package Attributes

No Bid

1. Brand Name

[No response

2. Model Number

[No response

3. Grade

INo response |

4. 3600 Lumens (minimum)

|No response |
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5. Multiple Input Sources

[No response |

6. LED or Bulb
Please list Model Number

INo response |

7. Compatible with Widescreen Display Source Ratios

|No response |

8. Manufacturer Warranty

INo response |

Package Items

5.1 Projector

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
5.2 Mounting Bracket
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Package Header

Portable Projector
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

|No response |
2. Model Number

|No response |
3. Grade

[No response |

4. 3600 Lumens (minimum)

INo response |

5. Multiple Input Sources

|No response |

6. LED or Bulb
Please list Model Number

INo response |

7. Compatible with Widescreen Display Source Ratios

[No response |

8. Manufacturer Warranty

INo response |
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Package Items

6.1 Projector

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
6.2 Mounting Bracket
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7/ |Package Header

Projector Screen/ Option 1
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

[No response |
2. Model Number

[No response |
3. Size

[No response |

4. Drop Down or Pull Down

INo response |

5. Manufacturer Warranty

|N0 response |

Package Items

7.1 Projector Screen
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8 [Package Header

Projector Screen/ Option 2
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Brand Name

[No response |
2. Model Number

[No response |
3. Size

[No response |

4. Drop Down or Pull Down

[No response |
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5. Manufacturer Warranty

[No response |

Package Items

8.1 Projector Screen
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9| Package Header

Sound Systems/ Option 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Total: $139.98

Package Attributes

1. Digital to Analog Conversion
List Brand & Model #
|Yes |
2. Able to plug into laptop and other aux devices
List Brand & Model #
|Yes |
3. Bluetooth compatible
List Brand & Model #
|Yes |
4. Manufacturer Warranty
List Brand & Model #
|1 year |

Package Items

9.1 Sound Bar for Classroom

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $69.99 | Total: | $69.99 |
9.2 Audio Enhancement System

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
9.3 Amp/Speaker for a classroom projector

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
9.4 Powered External Speaker for classroom

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9.5 Powered External Speaker for larger room, ex: Gym

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $69.99 | Total: | $69.99 |

1| Package Header

Sound Systems/ Option 2
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
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Package Attributes

1. Digital to Analog Conversion
List Brand & Model #
INo response |

2. Able to plug into laptop and other aux devices
List Brand & Model #
|No response |

3. Bluetooth compatible
List Brand & Model #
|No response |

4. Manufacturer Warranty
List Brand & Model #
[No response |

Package Items

10.1 Sound Bar for Classroom

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
10.2 Audio Enhancement System

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
10.3 Amp/Speaker for a classroom projector

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
10.4 Powered External Speaker for classroom

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
10.5 Powered External Speaker for larger room, ex: Gym

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1| Package Header

Wireless Device: Kramer VIA GO
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Manufacturer Warranty

|No response |

2. Notes to Add
Please list any additional notes related to this item.

[No response

Package Items

11.1 Wireless Device: Kramer VIA GO
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1| Package Header
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Interactive Display: SMART (65"-80")
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Size

|No response

2. Mount Option
List Brand & Model #
INo response |

3. Ethernet port available

|No response |

4. Manufacturer Warranty

INo response |

Package Items
12.1 Interactive Display: SMART (65"-80")

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
12.2 Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
12.3 Cart Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

12.4 Total for Interactive Display w/ Cart Mount Bracket Option
Quantity: 1 UOM: Total No Bid

1| Package Header

Interactive Display: BEN Q (65"-80")
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Package Attributes

1. Size

[No response

2. Mount Option
List Brand & Model #
INo response |

3. Ethernet port available

|No response |

4. Manufacturer Warranty

INo response |

Package Items
13.1 Interactive Display: BEN Q (65"-80")
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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13.2 Wall Mount Bracket Option

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
13.3 Cart Mount Bracket Option
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

13.4 Total for Interactive Display w/ Cart Mount Bracket Option
Quantity: 1 UOM: Total No Bid

1| Package Header

Installation Labor
No Bid

Item Notes: Prevailing Wage will apply to new installation on walls or ceilings and for cable or wiring pulled. Please
reference Annual Wage Order Number 26 in the Attachments tab.

Package Items

14.1 Labor for installation of TVs mounted to wall

No Bid
14.2 Labor for installation of Projector mounted to ceiling
No Bid
14.3 Labor for installation of Sound System
No Bid
14.4 Installation of Interface Panel
No Bid
14.5 Labor for all other misc items not specifically listed
No Bid
1 | Minimum Labor Charge per trip (if applicable).
° No Bid
(13 It is the intention of the District to leverage buying power by placing a bulk order for all interested
schools, shortly after award of this bid. Quantities are not known at this time. Please indicate a
percentage off of price that you would offer the District for the bulk order.
No Bid

1 | From time to time, the District may have a need for an item not specifically mentioned in this bid. Please list
7 | percentage off of any other item not specifically listed

No Bid

Response Total: $2,539.86

Page 13 of 13 pages Vendor: Best Buy Stores, L.P. B-19/20-04



